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Should Governments Reduce the Legal Drinking Age?

The trend of alcohol consumption within Americans has been increasing, prompting discourse from
health officials, researchers, policy makers, libertarians and industry representatives to question whether
governments should reduce the legal drinking age to discourage drinking, especially amongst young people1.
This paper will explore the history of alcohol consumption as a whole, varied audiences affected by the
drinking age limitations, and evaluate viewpoints of experts and individuals regarding whether governments
should ultimately lower the legal drinking age. Contributing to expert debates of determining the optimal legal
drinking age to minimize and prevent excessive drinking and abuse at a younger age, these viewpoints
underscore the fear of people abusing alcohol and whether “drinking low or moderate amounts of alcohol
damages one’s health,” which in terms outlines whether the focus of the government should be reducing the
legal drinking age or “limit adolescents’ exposure to alcohol advertising2.” Thus, the government should not
reduce the legal drinking age; but rather, focus on limiting the exposure and educating individuals of the
negative consequences – especially younger generations – to reduce alcohol-related accidents and abuse.

The Federal Uniform Drinking Age Act of 1984 states that the minimum legal drinking age is 21 –
including any public possession – which all states must act in accordance with that standard3. The general
policy specifies that the Federal government “can withhold ten percent of Federal funding for highways from
States” hat do not abide by the standards4. However, the loose definition of public possession permits states to
determine whether certain individuals under 21 can drink such as for medical purposes, accompanied by a
parent or guardian over 21, or etc5. Alcoholic beverages include “beer, distilled spirits and wine containing
one-half of one percent or more of alcohol by volume6.”

The Alcohol Policy Information System (APIS) underlies that underage drinking is a major public
health issue, as it is a popular choice of drug among adolescents and youths7. Historically, restricting and
limiting access purchases and consumptions of alcohol were first set in the early 20th century, which has
become gradually more restrictive as time progresses. In fact, the 18th Amendment (1919) prohibited the
purchase of alcoholic beverages as a whole in the United States, which was later repealed in 1933 due to the
“rise to organized crime that trafficked in illegal alcohol,” which illustrates that completely abolishing an issue
does not immediately resolve the issue in the long-term8. In the span of 1970 to 1975, “29 States lowered their
minimum drinking ages from 21 to 18, 19, or 20, following the enactment of the 26th Amendment to the U.S.
Constitution” and by “the 1980s, States began to return the minimum drinking age to 21,” ultimately due to the
research showing a direct correlation between alcohol accidents to lower minimum drinking ages. The
National Minimum Drinking Act still remains to this day, requiring that “States prohibit persons under 21
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years of age from purchasing or publicly possessing alcoholic beverages as a condition of receiving State
highway funds” with loose interpretation of public possession9. Today, alcohol remains as a useful yet often
misused drug today ranging from it positive health benefits such as in medical practices as “powerful
antimicrobial, astringent, sedative, and rubefacient properties” to its use as a “good polar solvent used to
extract active ingredients from raw materials,” which must be addressed in order to promote safe handling and
usage of alcohol10.

Authors Toomey, Rosenfeld, and Wagenaar of the journal “The Minimum Legal Drinking Age” assert
how research should be focused on determining the effectiveness of the minimum legal drinking age (MLDA)
and its ratio causing alcohol related problems rather than simply measuring the consumption. Based on results
from their research evaluating the correlation between alcohol and alcohol-related accidents to MLDA, “the
National Highway Traffic Safety Administration (NHSA) estimated that in 1987… 1,071 traffic crash fatalities
were prevented” due to the newly set MLDA of 2111. Thus, a higher MLDA directly correlates with lower
alcohol abuse and issues for younger individuals. Furthermore, “the New York State Division of Alcoholism
and Alcohol Abuse (1984) researched that 16-percent decrease in rates of vandalism in four States that raised
the MLDA,” which indicates that crime rates related to alcohol decreases as states raise the MLDA. The
research quintessentially summarizes that a “higher MLDA results in fewer alcohol-related problems among
use and that the MLDA of 21 saves the lives of well over 1,000 youth each year,”12 which should be continued
to be enforced by the government. However, these authors underlie crucial issues regarding the history of
setting the MLDA, which has been centered and controlled majorly by the states themselves rather than the
federal government. While it is federal rule to have states set their minimum drinking age to 21, this restriction
has not stopped teen drinking due to the lack of enforcement, state law consistency, and lack of accountability.
In fact, enforcement almost plays an equally important role in limiting alcohol consumption by limiting
potential young individuals and those purchasing alcohol for minors to do so freely and as conveniently.
Regarding enforcement, the lack of accountability – the fact that “only a tiny proportion of incidents of
minors’ drinking results in fines or other penalties for establishments that sell alcohol” – is not severe enough
to discourage venders or individuals from illegally granting access to alcohol to minors. Therefore, the lack of
enforcement agencies that cite or take legal action against illegal suppliers displays that society points
underage drinking and alcohol consumption being normalized and acceptable. According to these authors, in
some studies, the age limitation of 21 has “pushed underage binge drinking into private and less controlled
environments,” which can be fatalistic13. This correlates to the “rubber band effect:” youths consuming more
alcoholic beverages once they turn 21 to “make up for lost time,” causing these individuals to “drink at higher
rates” in comparison to those that were allowed to drink at a younger age14. The “rubber band effect”
contributes to those in favor of lowering the drinking age, arguing that teens should have the right and ability
to drink responsibility as “18 is the age of legal majority in the United States”15. This is because the
responsibility of reaching 18 years of age or legal majority includes voting in the local, state and federal
elections, marriage “without parental consent,” serving on juries, legally binding contracts, and the possibility
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of being drafted into service. Due to these conflicting studies, the authors strongly recommend to increase the
stakes of those who are “illegally selling or providing alcohol to youth,” by encouraging “ABC and local law
enforcement agencies to increase enforcement against illegal providers” – which studies have shown to greatly
reduce in alcohol sales “from 59 percent at baseline to 26 percent” after a year16. Along with funding stronger
enforcement, the authors emphasize updating the effectiveness of current “procedures and policies” such as
training employees the importance of identification checking to ensure that individuals understand the negative
consequences and the importance of MLDA laws. Ultimately, the studies point out that the government should
maintain the current 21 minimum drinking age as it is scientifically proven that “early legal access to alcohol
(i.e., at age 18) is associated with higher rates of drinking later in life” and “research shows that when the
MLDA is 21, people under age 21 drink less and continue to do so through their early twenties. Those who are
inclined to drink do not “make up for lost time” after turning 2117.” Thus, it is unnecessary to alter the MLDA.

According to the “Public Policy and Alcohol Use” by Richard A. Grucza and Andrew D. Plunk and
research “Commentary on Fitzpatrick and Colleagues (2012): Forecasting the Effect of the Amethyst Initiative
on College Drinking” by Rober B. Voas and James C. Fell, the government should focus on raising the alcohol
tax, discouraging and censoring alcoholic advertisements, and producing more media/public service
announcements focusing on raising awareness rather than targeting the legal age itself. Furthermore, while
drinking age is relevant and necessary to discourage drinking at a young age, this federal standard is often
disregarded amongst adolescents who do not understand the health and social consequences. The authors
discuss the amethyst initiative, which proposes that drinking is heavily engraved and often encouraged in
American culture, particularly underage drinking. While there are substantial evidence that depict heavy
episodic drinking (HED) within adolescence – particularly college students – in unsupervised and private
areas, causing misconceptions “regarding the normative level of student drinking” has raised a major source of
concern18. The study conducted by Fitpatrick and his copartners also known as the Amethyst Initiative
concludes that reducing the minimum drinking age is not effective to reduce college and or adolescent binge
drinking; but rather, it increases the possibility of alcohol-related issues encountered even by younger
audiences19. According to the Grucza and Plunk, aiding individuals to recognize the adverse effects of alcohol
rather than lowering the number itself is crucial to advocating for equitable and long-term effective alcohol
policy. For instance, the authors suggest that government can modify and improve policies that “influence
price (i.e. imposition of excise taxes), policies that influence availability (i.e. policies on density of outlets),
traffic policies (i.e. enforcing legal blood alcohol content), and youth access policies (i.e. prohibiting the use or
sale of false IDs)20. The authors recognize that alcohol misuse is a serious issue and suggest that rather than
reducing or altering the legal drinking age majorly, focus should be targeting on rewriting social expectations
and norms towards alcoholic beverage consumption.

Regardless of the research that indicates that lowered minimum legal drinking age correlates to greater
probability of accidents among younger individuals, the National Youth Rights Association, the drinking
standards set by the federal government promotes “unsafe drinking habits and fails to teach moderate use,”
ultimately depriving young adults of their newly granted freedom to adulthood but also depicts the
ineffectiveness of age injustices that should simply be removed as a whole. The NYRA outlines that
punishment is clear within the underage community through school expulsion, community service, driver’s
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license revocation, and other legal consequences21. In fact, it is now widespread that employees and bartenders
face major consequences for not checking individual identifications and serving minors. According to “The
Drinking Age and Traffic Safety” by Peter Asch and David Levy, increasing the minimum legal drinking case
to 21 simply “transferred drunk driving deaths from the 18-20 age group to the 21-24 age group,” confirming
that consequences related to drinking and driving is caused by the improper education regarding responsible
drinking rather than the number limit of 21 itself22. Therefore, NYRA conclude that reducing the legal drinking
age can teach younger individuals to start drinking responsibility rather than continually increasing the
drinking age – as it simply shifts the affected age group within that range – and studies has shown that
“countries with stricter alcohol prohibition” exhibit long-term alcohol problems23.

Despite the ongoing debate whether governments should lower the legal drinking age, authors
Toomey, Rosenfeld, and Wagenaar of the journal “The Minimum Legal Drinking Age” evaluates
alcohol-related accidents and issues as a majorly preventable one based on the research that shows
“effectiveness of a higher MLDA in preventing alcohol-related injuries and deaths among youth24.” As a
solution, they conclude and suggest to require stricter enforcement policies with greater consequences such as
“(1) requiring all alcohol servers to receive responsible service training on how to check age identification and
refuse sales to teenagers, (2) establishing systems to monitor servers to prevent illegal sales to youths, and (3)
posting warning signs25. The focus of their research was to predominantly determine whether the drinking age
of 21 positively benefits and reduces the number of alcohol-related accidents and to determine an effective and
cost-friendly solution to continue to reduce the number of alcohol-related issues. The authors ultimately
comment on how the government should focus on implementing varied strategies to change the environment
and social standards to create lasting impact and long-term transformation in adolescent drinking issues. The
approach begins with questioning of current standards, challenging enforcements to become stricter, and for
individuals to practice being ethical – which includes not purchasing alcoholic beverages for minors, not
purchasing alcohol utilizing false identification cards, and becoming responsible drinkers. The government
should ultimately maintain the 21 minimum legal drinking age and increase funding to implement tighter
regulations and consequences for those who do not follow the federal law.

In contrast, “Public Policy and Alcohol Use” by Richard A. Grucza and Andrew D. Plunk and
research “Commentary on Fitzpatrick and Colleagues (2012): Forecasting the Effect of the Amethyst Initiative
on College Drinking” by Rober B. Voas and James C. Fell claims that lowering or maintaining the minimum
legal drinking age is not as effective as directing government focus towards changing social beliefs and
targeting the American culture at its roots. Because alcohol is associated and normalized in diverse – typically
entertaining – settings, discouraging or warning individuals of such environments at an early age is an optimal
solution to reducing drinking issues and accidents. Furthermore, because the Amethyst Initiative concludes
that reducing the minimum drinking age is not effective but rather increases binge drinking or craving
something that is prohibited, enforcing stricter or increased drinking minimum ages may increase. The authors
are concerned more about drinking responsibly rather than the age itself. Thus, to promote responsible drinking
they suggest raising the alcohol tax – to discourage individuals from over splurging on alcoholic beverages or
consuming too many drinks in a single session. The authors additionally highlight promoting regulations on
censoring alcoholic advertisements to younger audiences that either market alcohol as an exciting, sexual, or
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festive product for personal enjoyment. This is problematic as younger individuals are exposed to misleading
information which should be countered or balanced with public service announcements and advertisements
that focus on raising awareness of the negative health effects and consequences that comes with drinking.
Therefore, contributing to expert debates on determining the optimal legal drinking age to minimize and
prevent excessive drinking and abuse at a younger age, the government should focus on promoting responsible
drinking rather than focusing on the number on which they should set. Further research should be conducted to
determine whether drinking moderate amounts damages one’s health at a younger age versus binge drinking at
a higher age.

The government should implement the following policies to ensure long-term effective alcohol abuse
prevention. (1) Policy on redefining the punishment and procedure for sellers and providers regarding selling
alcoholic beverages to minors. This can include a certain warning followed up by an increasing fine for those
who do not adhere to the law. The policy should be enforced by police or legal enforcements which must be
accounted for through a system of the government monitoring the enforcement officials to meet a certain quota
or reward those who capture and take legal actions against those who are not complying with the law.
However, this will not be possible without government funding and close interaction with the enforcement. (2)
The second policy should be to increase public service announcements and warnings to counter the
misinformation regarding alcoholic beverages. This can range from promoting warnings on the negative health
effects that come along with drinking to promoting first hand experiences with alcohol-related accidents.
While this may be disturbing to some individuals, promoting such strong images with a clear message and
intent promotes individuals to better understand that alcohol is not simply for entertainment but a drug that is
illegal for those who are under 21. (3) The final policy should focus on educating young audiences the
historical context, contents, and precisely  what alcohol is, its harmfulness, and how to utilize it responsibly.
This is because completely practicing not drinking alcohol is realistically impossible for curious adolescents
and the American social culture in general. Instead, the government should teach individuals how to drink
responsibly, avoid binge drinking, and exactly what the consequences are when it comes to drinking. Drinking
is quintessentially an ongoing debatable issue of whether or not is should be limited to a certain age range,
however, it is crucial that the government continues to utilize scientific evidence along with just judgment on
how to reduce irresponsible drinking and alcohol-related accidents by funding programs to help advocate
alcohol issues, stronger enforcements, and ultimately to establish a long-term effective solution for the rising
younger generation to redefine the American culture of drinking responsibly.


